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📌 Summary Table of PPP Pipeline Projects 

S/N Project Name & Description 
Sponsoring 
MDA 

Location Sector Phase 
Estimated 
Cost 

Timeline Status Partner 

1 

Danbaba Suntai Airport 
Rehabilitation: Upgrade and 
expansion of airport facilities to 
improve regional connectivity 
and tourism. 

Ministry of 
Works 

Jalingo 
Transport & 
Aviation 

Feasibility 
Completed 

$10 
million 

2023–
2028 

In 
Progress 

CCECC 
(China) 

2 

Hydropower Development 
Project: Construction of a 
medium-scale hydroelectric 
plant to boost energy supply 
across Taraba State. 

Ministry of 
Works 

Gembu 
Energy & 
Utilities 

Feasibility 
Completed 

$5 million 
2023–
2028 

In 
Progress 

CCECC 
(China) 



S/N Project Name & Description 
Sponsoring 
MDA 

Location Sector Phase 
Estimated 
Cost 

Timeline Status Partner 

3 

Integrated Infrastructure 
Expansion: Road network 
upgrades, bridge construction, 
and resource management 
systems. 

Ministry of 
Works 

Statewide 
Transport & 
Infrastructure 

Planning 
Stage 

$2 million 
2023–
2028 

In 
Progress 

CCECC 
(China) 

4 

Agricultural Mechanization & 
Storage: Deployment of 
mechanized farming tools and 
construction of modern storage 
facilities. 

Taraba 
Investment 
Promotion 
Agency 

Wukari Agriculture 
Feasibility 
Completed 

$8 million 
2023–
2028 

In 
Progress 

CCECC 
(China) 

5 

Large-Scale Irrigated Farming & 
Export Hub: Development of 
2,000 hectares for irrigated 
farming and export processing. 

Taraba 
Investment 
Promotion 
Agency 

Lau 
Agriculture & 
Trade 

Planning 
Stage 

$2 million 
2023–
2028 

Inquiry 
Stage 

Lesney 
Partners 
(UK) 

 

 Climate Screening Summary 

All five projects have undergone preliminary climate screening to assess alignment with Nigeria’s Nationally Determined Contributions 
(NDCs) and Net-Zero 2060 goals. At least 50% of the pipeline meets climate adaptation and mitigation criteria, including: 

 Low GHG emissions 

 Renewable energy integration 



 Sustainable land use practices 

Download the full Climate Screening  

 

 

 Additional Resources 

 Taraba PPP Office Website 

 Download PPP Pipeline Spreadsheet 

 Executive Order No. 7 of 2023 – PPP Framework 

 

 

https://tarabastate-docs.s3.eu-central-1.amazonaws.com/guidance-and-regulations/ppp/climate-screening-report-for-ppp.pdf
https://www.tarabastategov.cloud/government/ppp-office
https://view.officeapps.live.com/op/view.aspx?src=https%3A%2F%2Ftarabastate-docs.s3.eu-central-1.amazonaws.com%2Fguidance-and-regulations%2Fppp%2Fprojects.xlsx&wdOrigin=BROWSELINK
https://www.tarabastategov.cloud/government/ppp-office

